
Shared Ownership Resales  

Application Form  

Guidance Notes  

 Please read the Information Sheet provided before filling in this form   

 Please do not fill in this form if you currently own your own home and do not have a sale agreed  

 You must not instruct a solicitor or agree a sale with the seller until your application has been 

approved by us  

 Please give as much detail as possible. It could delay the assessment of your application if we need to 

contact you for more information   

 Any joint purchasers on this application must also be named on the mortgage offer, and subsequently 

the lease of the property  

 We cannot approve applications from purchasers requiring a guarantor for their mortgage  

 We will contact you to inform you of the outcome of your application and tell you what to do next  

Send your completed form and supporting documentation to:  

Riverside Home Ownership  

2 Estuary Boulevard, Estuary Commerce Park 

Liverpool, L24 8RP 

Or by email to rho.resales@riverside.org.uk  



If you need help filling in your form or have any questions, please contact us:  

0345 155 9029           rho.resales@riverside.org.uk  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

National Insurance No..................... 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

National Insurance No..................... 

 

 

 

 



 



 



 



 



 

 

 

 



9. Declaration 

Please read the following carefully. Each purchaser should then sign 

below:  
The Riverside Group will only process your personal 
data for the purpose of processing your application for 
housing and will hold your information in accordance 
with the Data Protection Act 1998.  

All information you give us on this form (and 
information resulting from contact with your landlord 
and/or employer) may be shared with the same only in 
relationship to this application.  

All information will be treated in the strictest 
confidence. We, alongside the local Help to Buy Agent 
reserve the right to take up any references relating to 
applicants as we consider it necessary and may also 
search the files of any credit reference agency which 
will keep a record of any such request.  

We must protect the public funds we handle and so may 
use the information you have provided on this form to 
prevent and detect fraud.  

Sensitive personal data such as racial or ethnic origin, 
offences (including alleged offences) and physical and 
mental disabilities are required under the Equal 
Opportunities monitoring statute. We may also share 
this information for the same purposes with other 
organisations that handle public funds. The information 
may be used for statistical surveys, which means we 
may pass this information in confidence to Homes 
England and agencies working on our and their behalf.  

Declaration:  

It is a criminal offence to knowingly or recklessly make 
a false declaration or withhold information reasonably 
required in connection with your application.  

I/we consent to the information I/we have given on this 
form being used for the purposes of this application.  

I/we have read the above and confirm that I/we have 
provided accurate and up-to-date information relating 
to my/our application for home ownership. I/ we 
understand that if it is found that false information has 
been given to obtain housing either knowingly or 
recklessly, appropriate legal action may be taken and 
Riverside and/or the Local Authority may seek 
possession of any leasehold tenancy granted.  

I/we understand that as a council, housing association 
or other public sector tenant, I/we will be required to 
give up my/our rented home on the day of completion 
if I/we buy or rent a home through this application.  

I/we authorise Riverside to pass information to other 
application agents, Registered Providers, local 
authorities, financial advisors, credit reference agencies 
and to estate agents who may be able to assist in 
locating properties for applicants.  

I/we will authorise my/our Landlord to supply a rent 
reference to Riverside in support of this application if 
necessary. I/we will authorise my/our employer to 
disclose to Riverside any information relevant to this 
application.  

Purchaser 1  Signature ..............................................   Date ...........................   

Print name .............................................   

Purchaser 2  Signature ..............................................   Date ...........................   

Print name .............................................   

 

 

 

Send your completed form and supporting documentation to:  Riverside Home Ownership, 2 Estuary Boulevard, Estuary Commerve Park, 

Liverpool, L24 8RP or by email to sales@riverside.org.uk  

Riverside Home Ownership is a trading name of The Riverside Group Limited.  
Registered Office: 2 Estuary Boulevard, Estuary Commerce Park, Liverpool L2li 8RF. A charitable Registered Society under the 

Co-operative and Community Benefit Societies Act 201 li.  



Gypsy/Romany/Irish Traveller 

If any other background not stated above, please give details here 

Prefer not to say 



 

 

Gender  

 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

  

 
  

  


